Approved by

RFB 2013-302: Road Signs and Markers JAN 1 4 201"
Recap Sheet
Opening Date: December 27, 2012, 2:00 p.m., at Johnson County Purchasing Office
Vendor 1 Vendor 2 Vendor 3 Vendor 4 Vendor § Vendor 6 Vendor 7 Vendor 8
Vendor Hall Signs Pathmark KMP Roadrunner Lightle Ent. Vulcan Sign SA-SO Custom Products
Graphics \
Address Bloomington, San Marcos, Burleson, Fort Worth, TX | Frankfurt, OH Foley, AL Arlington, Jackson, MS <
IN TX TX TX
Section A . _ ,
Engineer/Prismatic Grades No Bid Eng Pris No Bid Eng Pris Eng | Pris | Eng | Pris | En Pris | Eng | Pri Hdw
12x 18 6.90 7.20 23.25 28.20 | 722 | 745 | 552 | 6.50 | 1131|1290 [ 536 | 5.64 .86
12 x 36 13.80 | 14.10 31.10 3580 | 144511490 11.13 { 12.80 | 18.60 { 21.80 | 10.03 | 11.28 .86
18 x 24 13.80 | 14.10 31.80 3580 | 1445 | 1490 | 10.72 | 12.53 | 18.60 | 21.80 | 10.03 | 11.25 .86
18 x 48 27.60 | 27.90 49.25 67.25 | 28.89 | 29.79 | 20.82 | 24.48 | 37.20 | 43.60 | 19.21 | 22.56 1.72
24x24 18.40 | 18.70 37.50 49.95 119.26 | 19.86 | 14.25 | 16.65 | 36.10 | 30.40 | 13.35 | 15.04 .86
24 x 30 23.00 | 24.00 43.85 57.10 | 24.08 | 24.82 [ 17.82 | 20.82 | 31.00 | 36.33 | 16.62 | 18.80 .86
24 x 48 37.00 | 38.00 68.85 93.25 | 38.52 |39.72 | 28.67 [ 33.46 | 46.93 | 55.47 | 25.70 | 30.08 1.72
24 x 60 50.00 | 52.00 96.60 | 128.10 | 48.15 | 49.65 | 34.70 | 40.80 | 59.33 | 70.00 | 31.72 | 37.60 1.72
30x30 27.75 | 30.00 61.00 76.75 | 30.09 | 31.03 | 22.03 | 25.81 | 37.08 | 45.08 [ 20.08 | 23.50 .86
30x36 36.00 | 37.00 65.40 88.10 | 36.11 | 37.24 | 26.68 [ 31.19 | 44.50 | 52.50 | 24.09 | 28.20 1.72
30x48 50.00 | 52.00 80.25 112.9 [ 48.15 | 49.65 | 35.76 | 41.75 | 59.33 | 70.00 | 31.72 | 37.60 1.72
30x 60 65.00 | 67.00 98.20 | 134.50 | 60.19 | 62.06 | 44.40 | 51.92 | 74.16 | 87.50 | 39.53 | 47.00 1.72
30x30x30 25.00 | 27.00 105.00 | 120.80 | 15.89 | 16.40 | 11.08 | 13.35 | 37.08 | 45.08 | 10.49 | 12.89 .86
36 x 36 43.00 | 45.00 74.85 101.00 | 43.34 | 44.69 | 32.08 | 37.48 | 51.80 | 61.40 | 28.55 | 33.84 | 1.72
36 x 48 59.00 | 61.00 92.50 | 128.00 | 57.78 | 59.58 | 41.64 | 48.96 | 69.06 | 81.87 | 38.07 | 45.12 1.72
30 inch Stop sign _ 23.00 | 25.00 29.75 36.10 | 28.50 | 29.50 | 20.34 | 24.24 | 37.08 | 45.08 | 19.36 | 22.69 .86
6 x 18 Street 5.50 5.80 4.60 5.10 | 460 | 5.10 | 433 [ 5.59 | 12.65 | 14.25 | 6.83* | 9.05* | 4.43**
6 x 24 Street 7.50 7.80 6.20 690 | 6.20 | 6.90 [ 576 | 7.43 | 14.20 [ 16.33 ] 9.10* | 12.06* | 4.43**
CUSTOM.: Prismatic by inch 4.90 sq ft .195 sq in No bid .07 sq in .045 sq in .05 sq in .05 sq in
CUSTOM: engineer by inch 4,00 sq fi .156 sq in No bid .06 sq in .041 sq in .06 sq in .04 sq in
nCm,_,OHS" Hardware (option) No bid No bid No bid §7.00/100 u No bid No bid .86
ROAD MARKER: 6 x 3 19.95 No bid Hionly 1.25 ea Hi only .90 No bid 26.92 ia
ROAD MARKER: 48 inch 19.95 No bid 62” Cars 16.24 CRM 13.60 No bid No bid
Misc Info Case: 25/box 20/case 3 color - .50 1 color signs: for each
sq ft add color add 10%
20/ case * w/ name
Over $5000 — ** 5.5” blade holder

3% discount

& cap for round or v-
channel

Attest: Pam Causey, Asst. Purchasing Agent; Heather Carmichael, Buyer




